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In the wake of the Iranian revolution of 1978/79, the regime that took power sought to establish a form of
government modelled on a particular understanding of political Islam. And since this revolution, Shi'i Islam
has been used in various ways to justify political activity, both by those in government and those in
opposition. As a result, outsiders often see 'Islamist ideology' in Iran as a monolith: unchanging and uniform.
But as Majid Mohammadi shows in this book, the field of Islamist discourse is actually extremely wide,
varied and in constant flux. By charting the central concepts and nuances of the ideological map of post-
revolutionary Iran, he demonstrates how Iranian clerics, religious and secular intellectuals, and political
theoreticians and activists have responded to cultural, political and social transformations since the
revolution.
Political Islam in Post-Revolutionary Iran offers a wide-ranging analysis of the various different ways of
conceiving of themes such as state power, democracy, human rights, constitutionalism and justice.
Identifying a variety of strains of political Islam, such as a socialist Islamism, a nationalist Islamism, an
authoritarian Islamism or fascist Islamism, Mohammadi highlights how these ideologies have sought to
create social and political movements with the aim of monopolosing state control. He presents an integrated
historical and comparative analysis of ideological production and intellectual conflicts in Iran by studying
both the different strains of political philosophy as well as the socio-economic contexts which surrounding
their birth and development. He includes here an examination of the ideological underpinnings of the
political rhetoric and policies of figures such as Ayatollah Khomeini, Ayatollah Khameini and the presidents
Hashemi Rafsanjani, Mohammad Khatami and Mahmoud Ahmadinejad.
With analysis of key thinkers such as Ali Shari'ati, Ayatollah Khomeini, Mohammad Taqi Mesbah Yazdi
and Abdolkarim Soroush, and different strains of political Islam, this book is a comprehensive account of the
diversity of Islamist ideologies in Iran, and how they interact with political reality.
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From reader reviews:

Melanie Archer:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information today can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a knowledge or any news even a problem. What people must be consider whenever
those information which is from the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously which one
works to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource then
you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will
not happen inside you if you take Political Islam in Post-Revolutionary Iran: Shi'I Ideologies in Islamist
Discourse (International Library of Iranian Studies) as the daily resource information.

Daria Gertz:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book especially book entitled
Political Islam in Post-Revolutionary Iran: Shi'I Ideologies in Islamist Discourse (International Library of
Iranian Studies) your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe
unidentified for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a book then become
one form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get ahead of. The Political Islam in Post-
Revolutionary Iran: Shi'I Ideologies in Islamist Discourse (International Library of Iranian Studies) giving
you another experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful facts for your better life
with this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind is going to be
pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary
investing spare time activity?

Cleveland Wheeler:

You can get this Political Islam in Post-Revolutionary Iran: Shi'I Ideologies in Islamist Discourse
(International Library of Iranian Studies) by go to the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it
may to be your solve problem if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various.
Not only by simply written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the
modern era such as now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem.
Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your publication. It is most important to
arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Judith Bradshaw:

E-book is one of source of expertise. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen need book to know the up-date information of year in order to year. As we know those books have
many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. From the
book Political Islam in Post-Revolutionary Iran: Shi'I Ideologies in Islamist Discourse (International Library
of Iranian Studies) we can take more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To get creative person must



like to read a book. Merely choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't always be doubt to
change your life at this time book Political Islam in Post-Revolutionary Iran: Shi'I Ideologies in Islamist
Discourse (International Library of Iranian Studies). You can more appealing than now.
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