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Every adult woman knows what it is like to be a gynecological patient. But what is it like to be the
gynecologist? What is the physician thinking while you lie on the examining room table? Does he or she
really care? What motivates someone to become an OB/GYN anyway? Marvin H. Terry Grody, M.D.
answers these questions in this collection of amusing and poignant anecdotes from his more than 50 years in
obstetrics and gynecology, including 32 years in private practice and 20 years as a medical school clinical
professor. No one has brought more zest and zaniness to OB/GYN practice than Dr. Grody and in this book
he shares his most memorable experiences. We learn about: The patient who was bitten in the "lettuce" by a
cat; The patient who called her gynecologist when her married lover died in bed; The patient whose cesarean
section was performed under local anesthesia; The patient who lost her "marbles;" The patient whose tumor
had a heartbeat; The patient whose "mum" died; and The patient with two vaginas - one for procreation and
the other for recreation; among many other gripping, true stories of medical heroics and a physician's
devotion to his patients. For those who mutter, "If only the doctor knew how it feels to be a patient," the final
chapter of the book will be especially meaningful. Dr. Grody describes his own near-death experience, one
that compelled him to repose the same trust in his doctors that patients had always placed in him. The
experience of being a gynecological patient is uniquely female, but this book speaks to the male gender, too,
as it opens men's eyes to a world their partners experience, but rarely discuss. Clearly a world-class
OB/GYN, Dr. Grody is a gifted raconteur, too.
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From reader reviews:

Melanie Tuck:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like looking
for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the publication entitled Rx for Happiness: An OB/GYN's Story. Try to the actual
book Rx for Happiness: An OB/GYN's Story as your close friend. It means that it can to be your friend when
you sense alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for yourself. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know every thing by the
book. So , let me make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Johnna Chapin:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This
reading behavior give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge even the
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on
what kind of reserve you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education books but if you want
experience happy read one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the Rx for
Happiness: An OB/GYN's Story is kind of guide which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Will Cathcart:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler to share. You
can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You will
observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to you
personally is Rx for Happiness: An OB/GYN's Story this guide consist a lot of the information with the
condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented how do the world has grown up. The
vocabulary styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some study
when he makes this book. Here is why this book appropriate all of you.

Bryan Donovan:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen require book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around
the world. By the book Rx for Happiness: An OB/GYN's Story we can have more advantage. Don't you to be
creative people? Being creative person must choose to read a book. Merely choose the best book that
appropriate with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book Rx for Happiness: An
OB/GYN's Story. You can more attractive than now.
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